
WHEREAS:
The Catholic Daughters of the 
Americas is a 120 year old 
international organization of 63,000 
women whose charitable mission 
includes fostering vocations to the 
religious life and promoting Catholic 
values of respect for the life and 
dignity of ALL persons;

And WHEREAS:

The Catholic Daughters of the 
Americas wholeheartedly supports our 
women religious who unselfishly 
dedicate their lives to God and others;

And WHEREAS:

A biological men’s group who call 
themselves “The Sisters Of Perpetual 
Indulgence” have for many years 
targeted Catholic women religious by 
means of profane and sacrilegious 
events, also appropriating and 
misusing Catholic imagery, persons, 
saints and sacred objects;

And WHEREAS:

The Los Angeles Dodgers baseball 
organization plans to feature the 
Sisters of Perpetual Indulgence as part 
of its June 16 
2023 10th Annual LGBTQ Pride Night, 
fully aware of that same group’s 
offensive and bigoted history toward 
over 70 million US Catholics;

BE IT RESOLVED THAT:



The Catholic Daughters of the 
Americas strongly condemns the 
actions of the Los Angeles Dodgers 
and urges all Americans to boycott 
Dodgers’ games and merchandise. We 
further demand that the Dodgers, who 
plan to showcase that group’s 
performative bigotry toward Catholics, 
especially Catholic women religious, 
cease this plan for June 16 and issue 
an apology to all Catholics.


