
Monthly Calendar

2025July
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

24

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

10:00AM - 4:00PM
English Institute
Eymard Room

25

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

10:00AM - 4:00PM
English Institute
Eymard Room

26

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

27

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

5:00PM - 6:00PM
OSDIA
FLC Library

28

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

10:00AM - 4:00PM
English Institute
Eymard Room

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

29

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

9:30AM - 11:30AM
Arts & Environment
Church

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

10:00AM - 4:00PM
English Institute
Eymard Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

30

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

31

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]

07/24/2025



Monthly Calendar

2025August
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

01

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

All Day
SSS Chapter Meetings - No
Other Events
Church, Eymard Room, Family
Life Center Narthex, St Julie
Billiart Rm, St. Ann Shrine

6:30PM - 8:30PM
Saint Eymard Holy Hour at
7:00PM

02

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

All Day
SSS Chapter Meetings - No
Other Events
Eymard Room

5:30PM - 6:30PM
Associates

03

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

All Day
SSS Chapter Meetings - No
Other Events
Eymard Room

9:00AM - 11:00AM
Baptism Prep Class
Parlor

10:00AM - 1:00PM
Helping Hands Meeting
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

04

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

All Day
SSS Chapter Meetings - No
other events on schedule
Church, Eymard Room, Family
Life Center Narthex, St Julie
Billiart Rm, St. Ann Shrine

1:00PM - 2:00PM
CC Meeting
Parlor

[A] 3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

05

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

All Day
SSS Chapter Meetings - No
other events on schedule
Church, Eymard Room, Family
Life Center Narthex, St Julie
Billiart Rm, St. Ann Shrine

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

06

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

All Day
SSS Chapter Meetings - No
other events on schedule
Church, Eymard Room, Family
Life Center Narthex, St Julie
Billiart Rm, St. Ann Shrine

11:00AM - 12:00PM
Rosary Makers Mtg.
Arkins Conference Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

07

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

All Day
SSS Chapter Meetings - No
other events on schedule
Church, Eymard Room, Family
Life Center Narthex, St Julie
Billiart Rm, St. Ann Shrine

08

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

All Day
SSS Chapter Meetings - No
other events on schedule
Church, Eymard Room, Family
Life Center Narthex, St Julie
Billiart Rm, St. Ann Shrine

09

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

07/24/2025



Monthly Calendar

2025August
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

10

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

7:00AM - 2:30PM
Blood Drive
Eymard Room

12:00PM - 2:00PM
Associate Formation
Parlor

11

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

6:30PM - 8:30PM
Leadership Knight
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Pastoral Council Mtg.
St Julie Billiart Rm

12

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

6:30AM - 8:00AM
Welcoming Committee
Parlor

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

3:00PM - 8:00PM
New Family Social
Eymard Room

13

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

14

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

8:00AM - 3:30PM
Faculty Mtg.
Eymard Room

15

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

8:00AM - 3:30PM
Faculty Mtg.
Eymard Room

16

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

10:00AM - 11:30AM
Associate On-Going Formation
Eymard Room

17

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

11:30AM - 12:30PM
Kindergarten Play Date -
Playground
Eymard Room

18

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

8:00AM - 7:00PM
School Mtg/Lunch
Eymard Room

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

4:30PM - 6:30PM
Meet Your Teacher
O'Brien Hall, School

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Liturgy Commission Mtg.
Parlor

19

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

20

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

21

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Prayer Shawl
Parlor

22

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

23

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen
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Monthly Calendar

2025August
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

24

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

5:00PM - 6:00PM
OSDIA
FLC Library

25

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
Opening Volunteer Staff Mtg.
OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Eymard Room

26

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
School Advisory Council Mtg.
St Julie Billiart Rm

27

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

28

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

[A] 7:30AM - 10:30AM
Preschool Meet & Greet
O'Brien Hall

6:45PM - 8:30PM
Open House (Gr. 1-8) EY, SC,
OBH, CH
Church, Eymard Room

29

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

30

All Day
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

31

12:00AM - 9:00AM
Construction on Roof No
events in ER or FLC
Eymard Kitchen

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]
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Monthly Calendar

2025September
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

01

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

02

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

[A] 3:00PM - 6:00PM
LPDC
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
St Julie Billiart Rm

03

4:00PM - 6:00PM
Associate Council
Eymard Room

6:00PM - 7:00PM
PTO Board Mtg
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

7:00PM - 9:00PM
PTO Mtg
Eymard Room

04

[A] 7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
Social Action Commission Mtg.
Arkins Conference Room

05 06

07 08

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR Open House OBH, SC,
GYM, ER, CH
Church, School

09

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

2:45PM - 3:45PM
Pastoral Staff Mtg.
Parlor

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Welcoming Committee
Parlor

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
O'Brien Hall

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

10

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

11

5:00PM - 10:00PM
Ladies Guild Wine & Cheese
Social
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

12 13

[A] 4:00PM - 6:00PM
Donut Sale for 8th Grade
Church Narthex

4:30PM - 9:00PM
Green Knights Mass & Bonfire
Church
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Monthly Calendar

2025September
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

14

8:30AM - 10:30AM
Confirmation Commitment
Pledge
School

12:00PM - 2:00PM
Associate Formation
Parlor

15

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

4:30PM - 5:30PM
Liturgy Commission Mtg.
Parlor

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Pastoral Council Mtg.
St Julie Billiart Rm

16

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Finance Council Mtg.
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

17

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

18

2:00PM - 4:00PM
Faculty Mtg.
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Prayer Shawl
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

19 20

10:00AM - 11:30AM
On Going Formation
Eymard Room
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Monthly Calendar

2025September
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

21 22

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR Night Prayer in Church  -
OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

23

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:30PM
School Advisory Council Mtg.
St Julie Billiart Rm

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
O'Brien Hall

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

24

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

25

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

26 27
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Monthly Calendar

2025September
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

28

5:00PM - 6:00PM
OSDIA
FLC Library

29

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Eymard Room

30

6:30AM - 2:00PM
Picture Day
Eymard Room

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]
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Monthly Calendar

2025October
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

01

6:00PM - 7:00PM
PTO Board Mtg
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

7:00PM - 9:00PM
PTO Mtg
Eymard Room

02

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:30PM
Social Action Commission Mtg
Arkins Conference Room

03

8:00AM - 3:00PM
Teacher PD Day
Eymard Room

04

05

9:00AM - 11:00AM
Baptism Prep Class
Parlor

10:00AM - 1:00PM
Helping Hands Meeting
Eymard Room

06

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Eymard Room

07

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

4:00PM - 6:00PM
Associate Council
Parlor

5:30PM - 8:00PM
FHC Commitment Pledge - CH,
ER, OBH, SC

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

08

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

09

6:00PM - 9:00PM
Ladies Guild Mtg.
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

10 11

5:30PM - 9:00PM
Mallia 10th Anniversary
Eymard Room
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Monthly Calendar

2025October
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

12

8:30AM - 10:30AM
Confirmation Session 2
School

12:00PM - 2:00PM
Associate Formation
Parlor

2:00PM - 6:00PM
Guardiani Italiani
Eymard Room

5:00PM - 6:00PM
OSDIA
FLC Library

13

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

5:00PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

14

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

9:30AM - 11:15AM
Small Group
Parlor

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Welcoming Committee
Parlor

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Finance Council Mtg.
St Julie Billiart Rm

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
O'Brien Hall

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study
Eymard Room

15

2:00PM - 3:30PM
Small Group - Gail
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

16

2:00PM - 4:00PM
Faculty Mtg.
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Prayer Shawl
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:30PM
Small Group - Rosalie
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

17 18

10:00AM - 11:30AM
Associate
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room
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Monthly Calendar

2025October
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

19 20

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

4:30PM - 5:30PM
Liturgy Commission Mtg.
Parlor

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR  Night Prayer in Church -
OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

21

7:00AM - 9:00AM
Knights of the Roundtable
Breakfast
Eymard Room

9:30AM - 11:15AM
Small Group
Parlor

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Memorial Mass
St. Ann Shrine

22

9:30AM - 12:00PM
Arts/Environment
Church

2:00PM - 3:30PM
Small Group - Gail
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

23

7:00PM - 8:30PM
Small Group - Rosalie
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

24 25
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Monthly Calendar

2025October
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

26 27

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Pastoral Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

28

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

9:30AM - 11:15AM
Small Group
Parlor

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
School Advisory Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
O'Brien Hall

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

29

2:00PM - 3:30PM
Small Group - Gail
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

30

7:00PM - 8:30PM
Small Group - Rosalie
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

31

9:30AM - 12:00PM
Arts/Environment
Church

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]
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Monthly Calendar

2025November
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

01

02

11:30AM - 1:30PM
Helping Hands Meeting
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

03

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

04

9:30AM - 11:15AM
Small Group
Parlor

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

05

2:00PM - 3:30PM
Small Group - Gail
Parlor

2:30PM - 7:30PM
Parent-Teacher Conferences
Eymard Room, O'Brien Hall

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

06

7:00PM - 8:30PM
Small Group - Rosalie
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
Social Action Commission Mtg
Arkins Conference Room

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

07 08
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Monthly Calendar

2025November
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

09

12:00PM - 2:00PM
Associate Formation
Parlor

10

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

11

6:30AM - 1:00PM
Picture Retakes
Eymard Room

9:30AM - 11:15AM
Small Group
Parlor

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Welcoming Committee
Parlor

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

12

2:00PM - 3:30PM
Small Group - Gail
Parlor

6:00PM - 7:00PM
PTO Board Mtg
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

7:00PM - 9:00PM
PTO Mtg
Eymard Room

13

6:00PM - 9:00PM
Ladies Guild Mtg.
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:30PM
Small Group - Rosalie
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

14 15

12:30PM - 4:30PM
Associate Retreat
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room, St.
Ann Shrine

07/24/2025



Monthly Calendar

2025November
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

16

8:30AM - 10:30AM
Confirmation Session 3
School

17

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

4:30PM - 5:30PM
Liturgy Commission Mtg
Parlor

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Pastoral Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

18

9:30AM - 11:15AM
Small Group
Parlor

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Finance Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

19

2:00PM - 7:30PM
Faculty Mtg./Fall Open House-
Prospective Families
Eymard Room, O'Brien Hall

2:00PM - 3:30PM
Small Group - Gail
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

20

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Prayer Shawl
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:30PM
Small Group - Rosalie
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

21

All Day
CRAFT SHOW SET-UP

9:30AM - 12:00PM
Arts/Environment
Church

22

All Day
CRAFT SHOW - NO OTHER
EVENTS
Eymard Room, Family Life
Center Narthex, O'Brien Hall,
School Gym
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Monthly Calendar

2025November
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

23

8:00AM - 7:30PM
L'ARCHE Cleveland Bake sale
Church Narthex

5:00PM - 6:00PM
OSDIA
FLC Library

24

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR Vocation Night - OBH,
SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

25

8:00AM - 11:30AM
Grandparent's Day
Eymard Room, O'Brien Hall

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Agape
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
School Advisory Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

26

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

27 28 29

9:30AM - 12:00PM
Arts/Environment
Church

30

7:00AM - 2:30PM
Blood Drive - ER

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]
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Monthly Calendar

2025December
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

01

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehearsal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

02

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

4:00PM - 6:00PM
Associate Council
Parlor

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

03

6:00PM - 7:00PM
PTO Board Mtg
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

7:00PM - 9:00PM
PTO Mtg
Eymard Room

04

3:00PM - 10:30PM
Ladies Guild - Ladies Night Out
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:30PM
Social Action Commission Mtg
Arkins Conference Room

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

05

4:00PM - 10:00PM
FCJC
Eymard Room

06

10:00AM - 11:30AM
Associate
Eymard Room

07

9:00AM - 11:00AM
Baptism Prep Class
Parlor

08

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehersal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR Immaculate Conception  -
OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH

09

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Welcoming Committee
Parlor

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

10

9:30AM - 11:00AM
Epiphany Packets
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

2:00PM - 4:00PM
Faculty Mtg.
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

11

1:05PM - 7:00PM
Jr. High Choir/Band Concert
Eymard Room, O'Brien Hall

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

12 13
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Monthly Calendar

2025December
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

14

8:30AM - 10:30AM
Confirmation Session 4
School

12:00PM - 2:00PM
Associate Formation
Parlor

15

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehersal
Church

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR Volunteer Thank you
Party OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

16

1:30PM - 2:30PM
Primary Christmas Concert
Church

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Primary Christmas Concert
Church, Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

17

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

18

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Prayer Shawl
Parlor

19

6:30AM - 8:00AM
Faculty/Staff Breakfast
Eymard Room

20

21 22

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehersal
Church

23

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

24

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

25 26 27

07/24/2025



Monthly Calendar

2025December
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

28 29

3:00PM - 4:30PM
Organ Rehersal
Church

30

1:30PM - 3:30PM
Tuesday Table Games
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

31

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]
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Monthly Calendar

2026January
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

01 02 03

04 05

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Liturgy Commission Mtg
Parlor

06

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Finance Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

7:00PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

07

6:00PM - 7:00PM
PTO Board Mtg
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

7:00PM - 9:00PM
PTO Mtg
Eymard Room

08

6:00PM - 9:00PM
Ladies Guild Mtg.
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

09 10

11

8:30AM - 10:30AM
Confirmation Session
School

12:00PM - 2:00PM
Associate Formation
Parlor

12

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

13

7:00AM - 9:00AM
Knights of the Roundtable
Breakfast
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

7:00PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

14

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

15

2:00PM - 4:00PM
Faculty Mtg.
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Prayer Shawl
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

16 17
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Monthly Calendar

2026January
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

18 19

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Pastoral Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

20

5:30PM - 8:00PM
FHC Reconciliation prep
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

21

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

22

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Preschool Open House
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

23 24

25

10:30AM - 2:00PM
CSW Open House
Eymard Room, St Julie Billiart
Rm

26

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

27

6:30PM - 7:30PM
School Advisory Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

7:00PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

28

10:30AM - 1:30PM
Teacher Luncheon
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

29

6:30AM - 9:30AM
K Sneak Peek/New Student 1-
8 Q&A
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

30

8:00AM - 2:30PM
4th Grade Wax Museum
Eymard Room

31

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]
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Monthly Calendar

2026February
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

01

9:00AM - 11:00AM
Baptism Prep Class
Parlor

10:00AM - 1:00PM
PSR CSW pizza party - OBH,
SC, GYM, ER, CH
Eymard Room

11:30AM - 1:30PM
Helping Hands Mtg.
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

02

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

03

6:30AM - 2:00PM
Group/Club Candid Pictures
O'Brien Hall

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

04

6:00PM - 7:00PM
PTO Board Mtg
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

7:00PM - 9:00PM
PTO Mtg
Eymard Room

05

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

06 07

08

12:00PM - 2:00PM
Associate Formation
Parlor

09

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Liturgy Commission Mtg
Parlor

10

5:30PM - 8:00PM
FHC Reconciliation
Church

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

7:00PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

11

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

12

6:00PM - 9:00PM
Ladies Guild Mtg.
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

13 14

15 16

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Pastoral Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

17

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Finance Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

18

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

19

2:00PM - 4:00PM
Faculty Mtg.
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Prayer Shawl
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

20 21
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Monthly Calendar

2026February
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

22 23

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR Night Prayer - OBH, SC,
GYM, ER, CH
Church

24

6:30PM - 7:30PM
School Advisory Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

7:00PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

25

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

26

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

27 28

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]
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Monthly Calendar

2026March
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

01

7:00AM - 1:00PM
Confirmation Retreat
School

02

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR Parish Mission - OBH,
SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

03

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

04

6:00PM - 7:00PM
PTO Board Mtg
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

7:00PM - 9:00PM
PTO Mtg
Eymard Room

05

5:00PM - 10:00PM
Ramadan Dinner
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

06 07

08

12:00PM - 2:00PM
Associate Formation
Parlor

09

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

10

7:00AM - 9:00AM
Knights of the Roundtable
Breakfast
Eymard Room

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

7:00PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

11

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

12

2:00PM - 7:00PM
Education Fair
Eymard Room, O'Brien Hall

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

13

2:00PM - 11:30PM
Craft Show set up
O'Brien Hall

14

All Day
Craft Show
O'Brien Hall

15 16

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Liturgy Commission Mtg
Parlor

17

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Finance Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

18

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

19

2:00PM - 4:00PM
Faculty Mtg.
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Prayer Shawl
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

20 21
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Monthly Calendar

2026March
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

22 23

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Pastoral Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

24

6:30PM - 7:30PM
School Advisory Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

7:00PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

25

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

26

6:00PM - 8:00PM
Ladies Guild Mtg.
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:30PM
OCIA
St Julie Billiart Rm

27 28

8:00AM - 6:00PM
Family Service Day
Eymard Room, O'Brien Hall

29 30

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR Reconciliation - OBH, SC,
GYM, ER, CH
Church

31

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]
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Monthly Calendar

2026April
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

01

6:00PM - 7:00PM
PTO Board Mtg
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

7:00PM - 9:00PM
PTO Mtg
Eymard Room

02 03 04

05 06 07

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

08

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

09 10 11

12

9:00AM - 11:00AM
Baptism Prep Class
Parlor

12:00PM - 2:00PM
Associate Formation
Parlor

13

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

14

8:00AM - 11:59PM
Kindergarten Screening
Eymard Room

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

15

12:00AM - 3:00PM
Kindergarten Screening
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

16

2:00PM - 4:00PM
Faculty Mtg.
Eymard Room

6:00PM - 8:00PM
Ladies Guild Mtg.
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

6:30PM - 8:30PM
Navigating the HS App Process
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Prayer Shawl
Parlor

17 18
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Monthly Calendar

2026April
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

19 20

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Liturgy Commission Mtg
Parlor

21

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Finance Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

22

7:00AM - 3:00PM
FHC Day School Jesus Christ
Day
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

23

1:30PM - 2:30PM
Gr. 4-6 Spring Concert
Church, O'Brien Hall

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Gr. 4-6 Spring Concert
Church, O'Brien Hall

24 25

8:00AM - 11:00AM
FHC PSR Jesus Christ Day
Church, Eymard Room

26

1:00PM - 6:00PM
Spring Tea
Eymard Room

27

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

28

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:30PM
School Advisory Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

7:00PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

29

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

30

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]
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Monthly Calendar

2026May
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

01

6:30PM - 8:00PM
OCIA
FLC Library

02

03

11:30AM - 1:30PM
Helping Hands Mtg.
Sr. Dorothy Kazel Room

12:00PM - 3:00PM
FHC Mass
Church, Eymard Room

04

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR - OBH, SC, GYM, ER, CH
Church

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Pastoral Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

05

6:00PM - 8:00PM
Academic Recognition
O'Brien Hall

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

06

9:00AM - 10:00AM
FHC Day School May
Crowning
Church

6:00PM - 7:00PM
PTO Board Mtg
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

7:00PM - 9:00PM
PTO Mtg
Eymard Room

07

1:00PM - 2:30PM
Jr. High Spring Choir Concert
Church

08

6:30PM - 8:00PM
OCIA
FLC Library

09

10

12:00PM - 2:00PM
Associate Formation
Parlor

[A] 12:00PM - 4:00PM
Confirmation with Bishop
Martin Amos
Eymard Room

11

5:30PM - 8:00PM
PSR May Crowning - OBH, SC,
GYM, ER, CH
Church

12

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Finance Council Mtg
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

7:00PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

13

2:00PM - 4:00PM
Faculty Mtg.
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

14

All Day
Band Concert
O'Brien Hall

6:00PM - 9:00PM
Ladies Guild Mtg.
Parlor

15

6:30PM - 8:00PM
OCIA
FLC Library

16

07/24/2025



Monthly Calendar

2026May
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

17 18

5:30PM - 8:00PM
Volunteer Thank you Party -
OBH. SC, GYM, ER, CH
Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Liturgy Commission Thank You
Dinner
Parlor

19

7:00AM - 9:00AM
Knights of the Roundtable
Breakfast
Eymard Room

6:00PM - 8:30PM
Bereavement Support Group
Parlor

6:30PM - 7:00PM
Memorial Mass
St. Ann Shrine

7:00PM - 8:00PM
Mens Bible Study - AR,DK
Arkins Conference Room, Sr.
Dorothy Kazel Room

20

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

21

10:00AM - 12:00PM
Preschool Graduation
Church, Eymard Room

6:30PM - 8:00PM
Prayer Shawl
Parlor

22 23

24 25 26

10:00AM - 11:30AM
Kindergarten Graduation
Church, Eymard Room

6:30PM - 7:30PM
School Advisory Council Thank
You  BBQ
St Julie Billiart Rm

7:00PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
Eymard Room

27

8:00AM - 2:30PM
Field Day
Eymard Room, O'Brien Hall

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

28

All Day
8th Grade Graduation & Social
Church, Eymard Room

29

8:00AM - 3:00PM
Closing Faculty Mtg.
Eymard Room

30

31

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]
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Monthly Calendar

2026June
SaturdayFridayThursdayWednesdayTuesdayMondaySunday

01 02

6:30PM - 9:00PM
Knights of Columbus
St Julie Billiart Rm

03

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

04 05 06

07

9:00AM - 11:00AM
Baptism Prep Class
Parlor

10:30AM - 11:30AM
FHC Procession for Solemnity
of B&B of Christ
Church

08 09 10

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

11

4:00PM - 9:00PM
Ladies Guild Installation Dinner
Eymard Room

12 13

14

12:00PM - 2:00PM
Associate Formation
Parlor

15 16

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Pastoral Council & Finance
Council Picnic
St Julie Billiart Rm

17

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

18 19 20

21 22 23

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Pastoral Council & Finance
Council Picnic
St Julie Billiart Rm

24

6:30PM - 7:30PM
Adult Choir - Church

25 26 27

28 29 30

Pending = [P]    Approved = [A]    Canceled = [X]
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